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In today’s eCommerce businesses, managing inventory is very crucial. The inability to manage 
inventory effectively plays a major in the downfall of a business. Poor stock control can lead to lack 
of real-time product information on the website, inaccurate order fulfilment, slow shipping speed 
etc. resulting in low brand loyalty and decrease in revenue. 
 
 
However, better inventory management can be achieved easily by leveraging the technology 
designed to simplify the process of managing stock control. Using the best technologies available 
you can streamline your business, lower costs and enhance productivity. 
 
 
Here are top perks of using technology to manage stock control: 
 
 
Better time management 
 
With the help of stock control technology, you can save both money and time. Keeping track of 
products you’ve in stock and the ones you’ve ordered to the suppliers become much easier. You 
can focus on products that are selling high rather than wasting your money on slow-moving 
products. This technology can even help in identifying from where you’ve received a package and 
where you’ve to store. It means stock control technology offers clarity as well as efficiency. 
 
 
Decreased stock-outs 

 
Businesses that manage their inventories effectively results in decreased stock-outs. Stock control 
technology can help your business achieve this as it provides you with an idea regarding the 
stocks you’ll need to meet the demand of the customers. It not only helps you avoid product 
shortages but also help you avoid stocking up of surplus products. 
 
 
Increased customer loyalty 

 
Customers come back to you only when they are satisfied with the service you offer. You need to 
improve your efficiency and accuracy if you want your customers to trust you and become your 
long-term customers. You can’t achieve this by manual method where your employees will match 
the stock received with the order. This is not only a time-consuming method but there is always a 
chance of human error and confusion. With stock control technology, you can remain assured that 
the right stock has been received against the customer’s order and ensures that the customer 
receives the ordered item quickly. 
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Organised warehouse 

 
Using technology to manage stocks, you can be the owner of organised warehouses. As it helps in 
identifying the best-selling items along with products that will have a good sale during certain 
times, you can organise the products accordingly. Along with ensuring a smooth warehouse 
operation, it lets you make your customers happy. 
 
 
Increased productivity 

 
As good inventory solution to manage stock control saves time, it results in better productivity. As 
the manual process gets reduced with stock control software, your employees can invest their time 
in other work. Things such as scanning products, knowing stock locations every time a product is 
moved etc. get much easier with the help of the technology you use making your warehouses 
highly productive. 
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